parch Ut

_-.Hl-‘-. f
S
,,ﬂ.
5
©
sl
I
@
=
VY
W
L
S
—
i
Q
=2
-
@)
e
Q.
Q
fyu
vi
A
St
_I

and shelter needed to sustain

America.
Manarch Waﬁtch

as an official Monarch Waystation.

as they migrate through N©

Certified and

|

& PROTECT MONARCH HABITATS

registered by
@ o 4
WWW. MONARCHVWATCH.ORG

CREATE, cﬁgﬁ VE,

oy 8 '
]
]




. .-._... ) e .
.. r—_... n ... . ..J.... .""_ . g I.
-r . .. ..-. .. .. ... w ‘-
L ..r
..q

..._-._. | ...._ ... |
0 I

-
.
q - b .
m
= \ ' j

)

" :
. _ .. T
-
- - e L=
5 ar L 1 oy
el S )
n =
- . 'I; b ; '-..!.“ ¥
o [
R
W e e

* educational lobby!

l.iI

e
=

S
7
@
&
e
N
&

_ Ij i
ol 'I- r

oF




Site Summé‘ry '

Filters (matching ALL filters):
sArea Number is between 1 AND 5

*Maintenance Type is not equal to 'Plant'

Comimon Species
=% Osk, Northem Red
8 Sweetgum
Linden, Littleleaf
& Maple, Norway
* Maple, Sugar
% Maple, Red
% Maple, Red-Red Sunset
London Planetree
Heneylocust
Ash, Green
Ash, White
Maple, Norway-Crimson King
“  Maple, Red-October Glory
Qak, Scarlet
Linden, Littleleaf - Greenspire
Black Gum
% OQak, Pin
# Maple, Sugar-Green Mountain

Pear, Callery
Qak, Swamp White
Katsuratree
Sycamore, American
4-0ak, White
Hawthorn, Winter King
&  Maple, Paperbark-Gingerbread
'Birch, River- Heritage
Oak, Chestnut
Hackberry

Hormbeam, American
_Japanese Tree Lilac
*  Maple, Red-Autumn Flame
,;:n.:zelkova, Japanese - Cofumnar
" Oak, Sawtooth
Cherry, Ckame

Sweatgum, Seadless - Rotunditoba

Tulip Tree
Dak, Willow
(gé Maple, Silver

w Maple, Norway-Columnar

B()F,(,”;g,k qffg/"}p(;m,“mq’ p/ e e e s e < < e e

© Sunday, November 17,2024

Tree Tracker
Count Percent
1,273 16.88%

436 5.78%
431 5.72%
376 4.59%
239 347%
236 3.13%
198 2.60%
185 2.69%
178 2.36%
158 2.10%
138 1.83%
121 1.60%
113 1.50%
112 1.49%
102 1.35%
99 1.31%
99 1.31%
g2 1.22%
88 1.17%
76 1.01%
73 0.97%
69 0.91%
66 0.88%
63 0.84%
62 0.82%
60 0.80%
60 0.80%
57 0.76%
65 0.73%
55 0.73%
55 0.73%
55 0.73%
54 0.72%
53 0.70%
53 0.70%
48 0.64%
44 0.58%
43 0.57%
42 0.56%

Pﬂge I 0_/'5“



Cormwnon Species
Hardy Rubber Tree
Dawn Redwood
. Oak, Black
Pear, Callery - Aristocrat
Black Gum - Wildfire
_#Maple, Sugar-tegacy
Maple, Sugar - Autumn Fest
# Oak, Shumard
Cherry, Sargent - Accolade
Linden, American - Redmond
London Planetree - Bloodgood
Horsechestnut, Red - Ft. McNair
"Oak, Shingle
Elm, Accolade

Horsechestnut, Red - Briotii
% Maple, Hedge
= Maple, Paperbark
Magnolia, Galaxy

ak, Chinkapin
Cherry, Higan-Autumn Flower
Cherry, Yoshino
Ash, Green - Nawport
Ash, White - Autumn Applause
Chokecherry, Canada Red
Hackberry- Magnifica
Serviceberry, Other
= Maple, Red-Sun Valley
Honeylocust - Skyline
Linden, American
® Maple, Norwegian Sunset
& Maple, Pacific Sunset
Cherry, Kwanzan
Honeylocust - Shademaster
Sweetgum - Happidaze
# Maple, Sugar-Fall Fiesta
Zelkova, Japanese - Green Vase
Kentucky Coffeetree
Linden, Silver - Sterling
Cherry, Japanese-Snow Goose
“#% Maple, Norway-Royal Red
Amur Maackia
Ginkgo - Autumn Gold
‘& Maple, Armstrong
s Maple, Red-Autumn Radiance

H?)Ma@gfs Vaf 'ﬂ§¢§'¢m§£§.‘if:g, P4

Count Percent

41
39
39
39
38
36
34
34
33
32
31
29
29
27
27
27
27
26
26
25
25
24
24
24
24
23
21
20
20
20
20
19
19
19
18
18
17
17
16
16
15
16
15

15

Staston: N()pgn;bgr 1 2024 e e e £ et et e

0.54%
0.52%
0.52%
0.52%
0.50%
0.48%
0.45%
0.45%
0.44%
0.42%
0.41%
0.38%
0.38%
0.36%
0.36%
0.36%
0.36%
0.34%
0.34%
0.33%
0.33%
0.32%
0.32%
0.32%
0.32%
0.30%
0.28%
0.27%
0.27%
0.27%
0.27%
0.25%
0.25%
0.25%
0.24%
0.24%
0.23%
0.23%
0.21%
0.21%
0.20%
0.20%
0.20%
0.20%

Page2of 5



Common Species Count Percent

Baldcyprééém e o e e e e e e » ST
Serviceberry, Aut Brilliance 14 0.19%
Silverbell, Mountain 14 0.19%
Cherry, Ckame-Dream Catcher 13 6.17%
Efm, American - Princeton 13 0.17%

# Maple, Hedge-Queen Efizabeth 13 0.17%
Pear, Callery - Redspire 13 0.17%
Persian Parretia 13 0.17%
Beech, European 12 0.16%
Birch, River- Dura Heat 12 0.16%

¥ Maple, Autumn Blaze 12 0.16%

# Maple, Red-Brandywine 12 0.16%
% Maple, Red-Red Pointe 12 0.16%
Snowbell, Japanese 12 0.16%
Ginkgo - Magyar 11 0.15%
Horsechestnut, Autumn Splendor 1 0.16%
Crabapple 10 0.13%
Dogwood, Kousa 10 0.13%
Ginkgo t0 0.13%
Hoily, American 10 0.13%
Hophornbeam, American 10 0.13%
Cherry, Japanese-Royal Burgundy 9 0.12%
Dogwood, Cornelian Cherry 9 0.12%
Sassafras 9 0.12%
Serviceberry, Spring Glory 9 0.12%
Yellowwood 9 0.12%
Birch, River - City Siicker 8 0.11%
Crabapple, Snowdrift 8 0.11%
Crabapple, Sugar Tyme 8 0.11%
Elm, Chinese - Aliee 8 0.11%
Horsechestnut, Red 8 0.11%
Linden, Littleleaf - Newport 8 0.11%
Mountainash, Korean 8 0.11%
Ginkgo, Princeton Sentry 7 0.09%
Japanese Pagodatiee - Regent 7 0.09%

“" Maple, Sugar - Commemoration 7 0.08%

- Maple, Tatarian 7 0.09%
Siiverball, Carolina 7 0.08%
Cherry, Sargent, Columnar - Pink Flair 6 0.08%
Stewartia, Japanese 6 0.08%
Amur Maackia-Starburst 5 0.07%
Birch, River 5 0.07%
Black Locust-Purple Rebe 5 0.07%
Dogwoad, Celestial 5 0.07%

Borongh of Wyoniissing, PA Sunday, November 17,2024 page3ofs



Common Species Count Percent

bbgﬁood, Rulgans B, o e e . 0.07%
Kentucky Coffeetrse - Espresso 5 0.07%
Linden, American - American Sentry 5 0.07%
Maple, Trident 5 0.07%
Oak, Bur 5 0.07%
Redbud, Eastern-Forest Pansy 5 0.07%
Turkish Filbert 5 0.07%
Zelkova, Japanese - Village Green 5 0.07%
Ash, Green - Patmore 4 0.05%
Cherry, Sargent 4 0.05%
Crabapple, Red Baron 4 0.05%
Dogwood, Flowering 4 0.05%
Elm, American - Liberty 4 0.05%
Fir, White 4 0.05%

£ Maple, Amur-Flame 4 0.05%

@ Maple, Norway-Cleveland 4 0.05%
@ Mapie, Sugar-Bonfire 4 0.05%

we Maple, Sugar-Columnare 4 0.05%
Sweetgum -~ Worplesdon 4 0.05%
Sweetgum, Moraine 4 0.05%
Sweetgum, Seedless - Cherokee 4 0.05%
Beach, European-Purple Ronhanil 3 0.04%
Birch, Himalayan 3 0.04%
Cherry-First Blush 3 0.04%
Crabapple, Prairiefire 3 0.04%
Hornbeam, European 3 0.04%
Linden, Silver 3 0.04%
Linden, Silver - Green Mountain 3 0.04%
Magnolia, Leonard Messel 3 0.04%
Magnolia, Saucer 3 0.04%
Serviceberry, Cumulus 3 0.04%
Beach, American 2 0.03%
Besch, European-Purple 2 0.03%
Black Gum - Green Gable 2 0.03%
Catalpa, Northern 2 0.03%
Corktree, Amur - Shademaster 2 0.03%
Dawn Redwood- Golden Dawn 2 0.03%
Elm, American 2 0.03%
Elm, Chinese 2 0.03%
Eim, Scotch 2 0.03%
Elm, Siberian 2 0.03%
Hackberry- Prairie Sentine! 2 0.03%
Japanese Pagodatree - Halka 2 0.03%
Katsuratree - Red Fox 2 0.03%

Borough of Wyomiissing, PA Sunday, November 17,2024 Paged of 5



Common Species Count Percent

Linden, Crimean . e e e e e e e ) " 0.05%
London Planetree - Columbia 2 0.03%
#Maple, Hedge-Matro Gold 2 0.03%
« Maple, Norway-Schwedler 2 0.03%
# Maple, Tatarian-Hot Wings 2 0.03%
= Maple, Tatarian-Pattern Perfect 2 0.03%
s Oak, Other 2 0.03%
Pine, Eastern White 2 0.03%
Planting Site Medium 2 0.03%
Beech, European - Purpurea 1 0.01%
Birch, Royal Frost i 0.01%
Cherry, Canada Red Flowering 1 0.01%
Cherry, Hillier Spire 1 0.01%
Crabapple, Donald Wyman 1 0.01%
Dogwood, Aurora 4 0.01%
Dogwood, Consteltation K 0.01%
Dogwood, Kousa-Rosabella 1 0.01%
Dogwood, Stellar Pink 1 0.01%
Eastern Redcedar 1 0.01%
Eim, American - New Harmony 1 0.01%
Elm, American - Valley Forge 1 0.01%
Hawthorn, Other 1 0.01%
Hickory, Bitternut 1 0.01%
Linden, Littleleaf - Chancellor 1 0.01%
Linden, Other 1 0.01%
London Planetree - Exclamation 1 0.01%
Magnolia, Daybreak 1 0.01%
Magnolia, Other 1 0.01%
Magnolia, Star 1 0.01%
s Maple, Amur-Ruby Slippers 1 0.01%
wMaple, Hedge-Greenstreet 1 0.01%
Maple, Red - Autumn Blaze 1 0.01%
» Maple, Sycamore 1 0.01%
-+ Dak, Southern Red 1 0.01%
Redbud, Eastern 1 0.01%
Serviceberry, Rebin Hill 1 0.01%
Sourwood 1 0.01%
Grand Total: 7,541
E———"

Borough of Wyemissing, PA Sunday, November 17,2024  PugeSors



ORDINANCENO. _[27]()  -2007

AN ORDINANCE OF THE BOROUGH OF WYOMISSING, BERKS
COUNTY, PENNSYLVANIA, REPEALING AND RE-ENACTING
CHAPTER 11, ENTITLED “HOUSING,” PART 1, ENTITLED
“PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE” IN ORDER TO ESTABLISH THE
MINIMUM REGULATIONS GOVERNING THE CONDITIONS AND
MAINTENANCE OF ALL PROPERTY, BUILDINGS AND
STRUCTURES LOCATED WITHIN THE BOROUGH OF WYOMISSING
TO ENSURE THAT STRUCTURES ARE SAFE, SANITARY AND FIT
FOR OCCUPATION AND USE; AND FOR THE CONDEMNATION OF
BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES UNFIT FOR HUMAN OCCUPANCY
AND USE AND THE DEMOLITION OF SUCH STRUCTURES.

WHEREAS, Section 1202(24) of the Borough Code, 53 P.S. § 46202(24) of the State of
Pennsylvania permits Boroughs to adopt ordinances regulating buildings and housing; and

WHEREAS, the aforementioned section of the Borough Code provides that the Borough
may adopt by reference thereto a standard code in order to regulate buildings and housing within
its geographical boundaries; and

WHEREAS, the Borough Council of the Borough of Wyomissing desires to adopt and
enact the 2006 International Property Maintenance Code as published by the International Code
Council.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ENACTED AND ORDAINED by the Borough Council of
the Borough of Wyomissing, Berks County, Pennsylvania, as follows:

SECTION 1. Chapter 11, Part 1 of the Code of the Borough of Wyomissing entitled
“Property Maintenance Code” is hereby repealed in its entirety and re-enacted to read as follows:

PART 1
PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE
§ 101. ADOPTION OF PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE,

The Borough of Wyomissing hereby adopts, for the purpose of establishing rules and
regulations for the maintenance of all structures, including administration, enforcement and
penalties, the property maintenance code known as the “2006 International Property
Maintenance Code,” as published by the International Code Council, Inc., save and except such
portions as are hereinafter deleted, modified or amended, of which three copies have been and
are now filed with the office of the Borough Secretary, and the same are hereby adopted and
incorporated as fully as if set out at length herein. From the date on which this Part shall take
effect, the provisions thereof shall be controlling in the maintenance of all structures, and in all
other subjects therein contained, within the corporate limits of the Borough.




§ 102. AMENDMENTS MADE IN PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE.

The Property Maintenance Code hereby adopted is amended as follows:

1843971-1

A.

=

LQ

lonl

Section 101.1, “Title,” is amended to read:

101.1. Title. These regulations shall be known as the Property
Maintenance Code of the Borough of Wyomissing, hereinafter referred to

~ as “this Code.”

Section 106.4, “Violation Penalties,” is amended to read as follows:

106.4. Violation Penalties. Any person who shall violate a provision of
this Code shall be, upon conviction, sentenced to a fine of not more than
$1,000 plus costs and, in default of payment of said fine and cost, to a
term of imprisonment not to exceed 30 days. Each day that a violation
continues after due notice has been served shall be deemed as separate
offense.

Section 111.2, “Membership of the Board,” is amended to read as follows:

111.2. Membership of the Board. The Board of Appeals shall consist of
the “Infrastructure Committee of the Borough of Wyomissing” formed
pursuant to Chapter 1, Part 3E of the Code of Ordinances of the Borough
of Wyomissing, Berks County, Pennsylvania.

Section 111.2.1, “Alternate Members,” is repealed.
Section 111.2.2, “Chairman,” is repealed.

Section 111.2.4, “Secretary,” is repealed.

Section 111.2.5, “‘Compensation of Members,” is repealed.
Section 111.5, “Postponed Hearing,” is repealed.

Section 111.6, “Board Decision,” is amended to read:

111.6. Board Decision. The Board shall modify or reverse the decision of
the Code Official by a majority vote of the members present.

Section 302.4, “Weeds,” is amended to read as follows:

302.4. Weeds and Grass. All premises and exterior property, including

- planting strips between the sidewalk and street surface or curb, shall be

maintained free from weeds or other plant growth including, but not
limited to, grass in excess of 10 inches. All plant material which blocks
visibility or access to any fire hydrant or any other fire department
connections, equipment or controls shall be removed. All noxious weeds

2




1843971-1

K.

shall be prohibited. Weeds shall be defined as all grasses, annual plants
and vegetation, other than trees or shrubs provided; however, this term
shall not include cultivated flowers and gardens.

“Weeds” as used in this Part means and includes any Canada thistle,
cichorium, intybus, Russian thistle, wild lettuce, wild mustard, wild
parsley, ragweed, milkweed or any other plant or vegetable whatsoever,
not edible or planted for a useful or ornamental purpose.

Every person owning or occupying any property in the Borough, upon
which any grass or weeds shall grow, shall not throw, place or deposit
grass or weeds for disposal in Borough streets, alleys or on the property of
another,

Upon failure of the owner or agent having charge of a property to cut
and/or destroy weeds and/or grass or dispose of weed and grass in
violation of this subsection, after service of a notice of violation, they shall
be subject to prosecution in accordance with Section 106.3. Upon failure
to comply with the notice of violation, any duly authorized employee of
the jurisdiction or contractor hired by the jurisdiction shall be authorized
to enter upon the property in violation and cut and destroy the weeds
and/or grass growing thereon, and the costs of such removal, plus 10%,
shall be paid by the owner or agent responsible for the property. Notice
pursuant to this subsection shall be given by personal service, United
States mail, first class postage, or by posting a notice of the violation at a
conspicuous location on the premises where the violation is occurring.

Section 302.8, “Motor Vehicles,” is amended to read as follows:

302.8. Motor Vehicles. Except as provided for in other regulations, no
inoperative or unlicensed motor vehicle shall be parked, kept or stored on
any premises, and no vehicle shall at any time be in a state of major
disassembly, disrepair, or in the process of being stripped or dismantled.
Painting of vehicles is prohibited unless conducted inside an approved
spray booth. Motorized vehicles shall not be parked on dirt or grass
covered surface. No more than three non-motorized vehicles may be kept
on any residential property and no more than one non-motorized vehicle
may be parked on a dirt or grass covered surface; provided, however, that
a vehicle of any type is permitted to undergo major overhaul, including
body work, provided that such work is performed inside a structure or
similarly enclosed area designed and approved for such purposes.

Section 304.3, “Premises Identification,” is amended to read as follows:

304.3. Premises Identification. Buildings shall have approved address
numbers placed in a position to be plainly legible and visible from the
street or road fronting the property. These numbers shall contrast with




their background. Address numbers shall be Arabic numerals or alphabet
letters. Numbers shall be a minimum of 4 inches (102 mm) high with a
minimum stroke width of 1/2 inch (12.7 mm). Numbers shall be
positioned at least 36 inches from grade and shall be clear from all
vegetation and/or seasonal decorations. If the premise identification
numerals are not parallel to the street, the numerals must be visible from
both directions of travel, to include one-way streets.

M. Section 304.14, “Insect Screens,” is amended by inserting “April 1st” in
the first area designated as “{DATE}” and “October 1st” in the second
area designated as “{DATE}.”

N. Section 307.2, “Disposal of Rubbish and Garbage,” is amended to read as
follows:

307.2. Disposal of Rubbish. Every occupant of a structure shall dispose
of all rubbish in a clean and sanitary manner by placing such rubbish in
approved containers. No more than two containers, per resident, for the
storage of recyclable materials shall be permitted for each residential
location. There is no limit for yard waste bags. Bulk refuse, including,
but not limited to, appliances, upholstered or other indoor furniture, and
tires shall not be placed outside of a structure for more than 10 days and
then, only for the purpose of proper disposal. Dumpsters placed for bulk
residential or construction waste shall not be placed on any property for
more than 10 days, or the duration of an active, permit-approved
construction project.

0. Section 602.3, “Heat Supply,” is amended by inserting “September 15th”
in the first area designated as “{DATE}” and “May 15th” in the second
area designated as “{DATE}.”

P. Section 602.4, “Work Space,” is amended by inserting “September 15th”
in the first area designated as “{DATE}” and “May 15th” in the second
area designated as “{DATE}.”

§ 103. STATE LAW AND REGULATIONS.

In all matters that are regulated by the law of the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania or by
regulations of departments or agencies of the Commonwealth promulgated by authority of law,
such laws or regulations, or other ordinances of the Borough, as the case may be, shall control
where the requirements thereof are the same as or in excess of the provisions of this Part. The
code shall control in all cases where the State requirements, or the requirements of other
ordinances of this Borough, are not as strict as those contained in this Part.

§ 104. PROVISIONS TO BE CONTINUATION OF EXISTING REGULATIONS.

The provisions of this Part so far as they are the same as those of ordinances and/or codes
in force immediately prior to the enactment of this Part, are intended as a continuation of such

1843971-1 4




ordinances and codes and not as new enactments. The provisions of this Part shall not affect any
act done or liability incurred, nor shall they affect any suit or prosecution pending or to be
instituted to enforce any right or penalty or to punish any offense under the authority of any of
the repealed ordinances.

SECTION 2. Inconsistent Ordinances Repealed. All ordinances or parts of ordinances
conflicting with any provisions of this Ordinance are hereby repealed insofar as the same affects
this Ordinance.

SECTION 3. Severability. The provisions of this Ordinance are severable and if any
section, sentence, clause, or provision hereof shall be held to be illegal, invalid or
unconstitutional by any court of competent jurisdiction such decision of the court shall not affect
or impair the remaining sections, sentences, clauses, or provisions of the Ordinance. It is hereby
declared to be the intent of the Borough Council of the Borough of Wyomissing that this
Ordinance would have been adopted if such illegal, invalid or unconstitutional section, sentence,
clause, or provision had not been included herein.

SECTION 4. This Ordinance shall be effective after enactment on the earliest date
permitted by law.

ENACTED AND ORDAINED as an Ordinance of the Borough of Wyomissing, Berks
County, Pennsylvania this (Qfgday of A pau L , 2007.

BOROUGH OF WYOMISSING

By: /:C _ll..l..L\

Thomas Heck, President of Borough Council

Attest: ﬁ ‘:;‘,;5 R/ oy,
Kevin Tobias, Secretary of the Borough

APPROVED as an Ordinance this /0 e day of A‘,w A , 2007.

Mc 'd;ztcm,é]o

Ronald Stanko, Mayor

1843971-1 5




PUBLIC NOTICE OF PROPOSED ADOPTION OF ORDINANCES

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Borough Council of the Borough of Wyomissing,
Berks County, Pennsylvania, will consider the adoption of two (2) proposed Ordinances which
will amend the Code of the Borough of Wyomissing no more than sixty (60) nor less than seven
(7) days from the date of this publication. The first such time this Ordinance will be considered,
and possibly adopted, will be April 10, 2007 at 7:00 p.m. at the Borough of Wyomissing
Borough Hall, located at 22 Reading Boulevard, Wyomissing, Pennsylvania 19610. A summary
of said Ordinances are as follows:

1. The Borough of Wyomissing does hereby repeal, re-enact and adopt Chapter 1,
Part 16, of the Code of the Borough of Wyomissing entitled “Intergovernmental Agreement for
the Westside Regional Emergency Management Agency,” which provides for the Borough’s
participation in a local emergency management agency comprised of various Berks County
municipalities to provide the residents and citizens of those respective municipalities and
communities with more efficient, responsive, cost effective and competent emergency
management services consistent with the requirements of the Pennsylvania Emergency
Management Services Code. The Ordinance is summarized as follows:

Said Ordinance does authorize the Borough of Wyomissing to execute and enter into an
Intergovernmental Agreement with the Borough of Sinking Spring, the Township of Spring and
the Borough of West Reading which will allow for the formation of a regional emergency
management agency to be known as the Westside Regional Emergency Management Agency. It
also provides a mechanism which will allow for the future participation of other municipalities.
The Emergency Management Agency shall consist of members from each of the municipalities
represented and shall establish polices and procedures to be implemented by each of said
municipalities with the goal of increasing the effectiveness of the emergency management
preparedness of each of the municipalities involved in said agency.

2. The Borough of Wyomissing shall also consider the repealing, adoption and re-
enactment of Chapter 11, Part 1 of the Code of the Borough of Wyomissing entitled “Property
Maintenance Code” which adopts the 2006 International Property Maintenance Code as the
property maintenance code for the Borough of Wyomissing. Said Ordinance provides for the
adoption of Chapter 11, Part 1 of the Code of the Borough of Wyomissing which is summarized
as follows:

ORDINANCENO. _{2.710  -2007

AN ORDINANCE OF THE BOROUGH OF WYOMISSING, BERKS
COUNTY, PENNSYLVANIA, REPEALING AND RE-ENACTING
CHAPTER 11, ENTITLED “HOUSING,” PART 1, ENTITLED
“PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE” IN ORDER TO ESTABLISH THE
MINIMUM REGULATIONS GOVERNING THE CONDITIONS AND
MAINTENANCE OF ALL PROPERTY, BUILDINGS AND
STRUCTURES LOCATED WITHIN THE BOROUGH OF WYOMISSING
TO ENSURE THAT STRUCTURES ARE SAFE, SANITARY AND FIT
FOR OCCUPATION AND USE; AND FOR THE CONDEMNATION OF




BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES UNFIT FOR HUMAN OCCUPANCY
AND USE AND THE DEMOLITION OF SUCH STRUCTURES.

A copy of the full text of each Ordinance may be viewed during normal business hours at
the Borough Hall of the Borough of Wyomissing, 22 Reading Boulevard, Wyomissing,
Pennsylvania or at the office of the Reading Eagle Company, 345 Penn Street, Reading,
Pennsylvania.

BOROUGH OF WYOMISSING

Kevin Tobias, Borough Secretary

1844821-1 2




PUBLIC NOTICE OF PROPOSED ADOPTION OF ORDINANCES.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Borough Council of the Borough of Wyomissing,
Berks County, Pennsylvania, will consider the adoption of two (2) proposed Ordinances which
will amend the Code of the Borough of Wyomissing no more than sixty (60) nor less than seven
(7) days from the date of this publication. The first such time this Ordinance will be considered,
and possibly adopted, will be April 10, 2007 at 7:00 p.m. at the Borough of Wyomissihg
Borough Hall, located at 22 Reading Boulevard, Wyomissing, Pennsylvania 19610. A summary
of said Ordinances are as follows:

1. The Borough of Wyomissing does hereby repeal, re-enact and adopt Chapter 1,
Part 16, of the Code of the Borough of Wyomissing entitled “Intergovernmental Agreement for
the Westside Regional Emergency Management Agency,” which provides for the Borough’s
participation in a local emergency management agency comprised of various Berks County
municipalities to provide the residents and citizens of those respective municipalities and
communities with more efficient, responsive, cost effective and competent emergency
management services consistent with the requirements of the Pennsylvania Emergency
Management Services Code. The Ordinance is summarized as follows:

Said Ordinance does authorize the Borough of Wyomissing to execute and enter into an
Intergovernmental Agreement with the Borough of Sinking Spring, the Township of Spring and
the Borough of West Reading which will allow for the formation of a regional emergency
management agency to be known as the Westside Regional Emergency Management Agency. It
also provides a mechanism which will allow for the future participation of other municipalities.
The Emergency Management Agency shall consist of members from each of the municipalities
represented and shall establish polices and procedures to be implemented by each of said
municipalities with the goal of increasing the effectiveness of the emergency management
preparedness of each of the municipalities involved in said agency.

2. The Borough of Wyomissing shall also consider the repealing, adoption and re-
enactment of Chapter 11, Part 1 of the Code of the Borough of Wyomissing entitled “Property
Maintenance Code” which adopts the 2006 International Property Maintenance Code as the
property maintenance code for the Borough of Wyomissing. Said Ordinance provides for the
adoption of Chapter 11, Part 1 of the Code of the Borough of Wyomissing which is summarized
as follows:

ORDINANCENO. _{2-1 0 -2007

AN ORDINANCE OF THE BOROUGH OF WYOMISSING, BERKS
COUNTY, PENNSYLVANIA, REPEALING AND RE-ENACTING
CHAPTER 11, ENTITLED “HOUSING,” PART 1, ENTITLED :
“PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE” IN ORDER TO ESTABLISH THE
MINIMUM REGULATIONS GOVERNING THE CONDITIONS AND
MAINTENANCE OF ALL PROPERTY, BUILDINGS AND
STRUCTURES LOCATED WITHIN THE BOROUGH OF WYOMISSING
TO ENSURE THAT STRUCTURES ARE SAFE, SANITARY AND FIT
FOR OCCUPATION AND USE; AND FOR THE CONDEMNATION OF



BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES UNFIT FOR HUMAN OCCUPANCY
AND USE AND THE DEMOLITION OF SUCH STRUCTURES.

A copy of the full text of each Ordinance may be viewed during normal business hours at
the Borough Hall of the Borough of Wyomissing, 22 Reading Boulevard, Wyomissing,
Pennsylvania or at the office of the Reading Eagle Company, 345 Penn Street, Reading,
Pennsylvania.

BOROUGH OF WYOMISSING

Kevin Tobias, Borough Secretary

1844821-1 2




PUBLIC NOTICE OF PROPOSED ADOPTION OF ORDINANCES

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Borough Council of the Borough of Wyomissing,
Berks County, Pennsylvania, will consider the adoption of two (2) proposed Ordinances which
will amend the Code of the Borough of Wyomissing no more than sixty (60) nor less than seven
(7) days from the date of this publication. The first such time this Ordinance will be considered,
and possibly adopted, will be April 10, 2007 at 7:00 p.m. at the Borough of Wyomissing
Borough Hall, located at 22 Reading Boulevard, Wyomissing, Pennsylvania 19610. A summary
of said Ordinances are as follows:

1. The Borough of Wyomissing does hereby repeal, re-enact and adopt Chapter 1,
Part 16, of the Code of the Borough of Wyomissing entitled “Intergovernmental Agreement for
the Westside Regional Emergency Management Agency,” which provides for the Borough’s
participation in a local emergency management agency comprised of various Berks County
municipalities to provide the residents and citizens of those respective municipalities and
communities with more efficient, responsive, cost effective and competent emergency
management services consistent with the requirements of the Pennsylvania Emergency
Management Services Code. The Ordinance is summarized as follows:

Said Ordinance does authorize the Borough of Wyomissing to execute and enter into an
Intergovernmental Agreement with the Borough of Sinking Spring, the Township of Spring and
the Borough of West Reading which will allow for the formation of a regional emergency
management agency to be known as the Westside Regional Emergency Management Agency. It
also provides a mechanism which will allow for the future participation of other municipalities.
The Emergency Management Agency shall consist of members from each of the municipalities
represented and shall establish polices and procedures to be implemented by each of said
municipalities with the goal of increasing the effectiveness of the emergency management
preparedness of each of the municipalities involved in said agency.

2. The Borough of Wyomissing shall also consider the repealing, adoption and re-
enactment of Chapter 11, Part 1 of the Code of the Borough of Wyomissing entitled “Property
Maintenance Code” which adopts the 2006 International Property Maintenance Code as the
property maintenance code for the Borough of Wyomissing. Said Ordinance provides for the
adoption of Chapter 11, Part 1 of the Code of the Borough of Wyomissing which is summarized
as follows:

ORDINANCENO. _ |27 0 -2007

AN ORDINANCE OF THE BOROUGH OF WYOMISSING, BERKS
COUNTY, PENNSYLVANIA, REPEALING AND RE-ENACTING
CHAPTER 11, ENTITLED “HOUSING,” PART 1, ENTITLED
“PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE” IN ORDER TO ESTABLISH THE
MINIMUM REGULATIONS GOVERNING THE CONDITIONS AND
MAINTENANCE OF ALL PROPERTY, BUILDINGS AND
STRUCTURES LOCATED WITHIN THE BOROUGH OF WYOMISSING
TO ENSURE THAT STRUCTURES ARE SAFE, SANITARY AND FIT
FOR OCCUPATION AND USE; AND FOR THE CONDEMNATION OF




Ordinance No. 1270-07

Section 302.4 - Controlled Plants, Noxious Weeds and Turfgrass. All premises and exterior
property, including planting strips between the sidewalk and street surface or curb, shall be
maintained free from weeds or other plant growth including, but not limited to, turfgrass in excess
of ten (10) inches. All plant material which blocks visibility or access to any fire hydrant or any other
Fire Department connections, equipment or controls shall be removed. All controlled plant and
noxious weeds identified by any government agency as a controlled plant or noxious weed.

Cultivated flowers, gardens, native or naturalistic plants, and managed natural landscape areas are
notincluded in the definition of “weeds”. Any area containing cultivated flowers, gardens, native or
naturalistic plants and managed natural landscape areas shall not include any plant identified by
any applicable government agency as a noxious weed. Managed natural landscape areas may
include plants and grasses of any height which have gone to seed. Managed natural landscapes
shall not include plants that, due to location and/or manner of growth, constitute a hazard to the
public.

Cultivated area may include garden beds that are both started from seed and or planted from live
plants.

Turfgrass is defined as continuous plant coverage consisting of a grass species thatis mowed to
maintain an established height.

Every person owning or occupying any property in the Borough, upon which any turfgrass,
controlled plants or noxious weeds shall grow, shall not throw, place or deposit turfgrass,
controlled plants or noxious weeds for disposal in Borough streets, alleys or on the property of
another.

Upon failure of the owner or agent having charge of a property to cut and/or destroy controlled
plants, noxious weeds or turfgrass or dispose of said items in violation of this subsection, after
service of a notice of violation, they shall be subject to prosecution in accordance with Section
106.3. Upon failure to comply with the notice of violation, any duly authorized employee of the
jurisdiction, or contractor hired by the jurisdiction, shall be authorized to enter upon the property in
violation and cut and destroy the controlled plant, noxious weed and/or turfgrass growing thereon,
and the costs of such removal, plus 10%, shall be paid by the owner or agent responsible for the
property. Notice pursuant to this subsection shall be given by personal service, United States mail
first class postage, or by posting a notice of the violation at a conspicuous location on the premises
where the violation is occurring.



e SRR TREEE YRR TR R I N A
. N
Search Google Maps A P

e

937 Old Mill Rd

Wyomissing, Fenngyivania

gle Straat View

\

o) Berks YRGIH (A

' S Wyomissing
_r R fd iﬁ}ﬂ-reek Parking




	20241120151125651
	1270-2007 IPMC
	IPMC Amendment Section 302.4 - Controlled Plants, Noxious Weeds and Turfgrass
	20241204144525601
	PXL_20241116_191120713
	PXL_20241116_192003406.MP

